
 

 

•

 



 

                                                  

.  



      
    

SALT Day Trip: Everyone 55 and over is invited to join the SALT ministry for a 
day trip to The Little White House and Callaway Gardens on Thursday, April 18.  
Visit the personal retreat of Franklin D.  Roosevelt and take in the vibrant 
azalea blossoms of spring at Callaway Gardens.  Cost is $60 per person and 
includes lunch at the Bulloch House restaurant.  Meet at church for an 8 AM 
departure.  Visit the Events page on our website to sign up. 

Parents Night Out is Saturday, April 20 from 6 to 9 PM. Drop off your kids at 
church and enjoy an evening out. Cost is $10 for one child and $20 for two or 
more. Open to infants through 5th graders. Sign up on the Events page on our 
website today. 

Family Picnic: Children’s ministry families, join us on Wednesday, May 1, from 
5 to 7 PM for a family picnic! We will enjoy Chick-fil-A boxed meals at 5 and 
play outdoor games. Sign up on our website today. 

Mother Daughter Tea: Ladies, we invite you to an Enchanted Garden Tea 
Party event on Thursday, May 9, from 6 to 7:30 PM at Primrose Cottage. This 
event is open to families with daughters aged 3 through 5th grade. Tickets are 
$15 per adult and $10 per child.  Registration is limited, so sign up today.  Visit 
the Events page on our website for complete details.   

POPs Concert: Don't miss our POPs Concert on Friday, May 17. Come and 
hear our First Baptist Roswell Orchestra perform a variety of musical hits, 
including big band ensembles, Broadway music, blockbuster songs, and 
patriotic tunes. Reception to follow the concert.  The concert begins at 7 PM in 
the Sanctuary.  While admission is free, we kindly ask that you consider a $10 
contribution per person. All proceeds will go to the Reuter Pipe Organ 
designated fund, which helps support the continuing maintenance and repair 
of our Sanctuary organ. 

The Grace Project ~ Annie Armstrong Easter Offering: Help us reach our 
church goal of $20,000 by contributing to our annual offering in celebration of 
the life and legacy of missionary Annie Armstrong. 100% of your donation 
supports North American missions. 

College Graduates: We want to recognize you! Please submit your name and 
your graduation school to Robert Turnbull at robert@fbroswell.org no later 
than Friday, May 10. 
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MUST Neighborhood Pantry on Mimosa:  Help support the MUST 
Neighborhood Pantry. The Mimosa pantry, located at Roswell United 
Methodist Church, meets on Tuesday, April 2.  Volunteers and donations are 
needed. Visit the Events page to sign up.  

Beyond Our Walls:  Registration is open for our annual day of service on 
Saturday, April 27, from 8 AM to 1 PM.  Stop by the Information Center today 
or visit the Events page on our website for service opportunities and to sign 
up.  Let’s share God’s grace beyond our walls. 

Wednesday Night Dinner and Activities:  We will not meet for dinner, 
children’s missions, youth activities, and adult classes on Wednesday, April 3.  
Dinner and activities will resume on April 10. 

Church Office Hours:  In observance of Easter, the church office will be 
closed tomorrow.   

Women on Mission will meet on Tuesday, April 2 in the Chapel at 10:30 AM. 
Come early at 10 to work on a mission project. Guest speaker is Belinda 
Harris, who works in literacy missions.  All ladies are welcome! 

Women’s Self-Defense Class:  All women are invited to a special self-
defense class on April 13, from 10 AM to 12 PM.  Led by members and 
certified instructors with WYKKO Karate, Ray and Jodi Nelson, the class will 
feature discussion about situational awareness, instruction and practice of 
basic strikes and escape moves, and time for questions and answers.  The 
class is open to women of all ages and there is no cost to attend. Register on 
the Events page of our website. 

Trivia Night: Youth and parents, join us for Trivia Night on April 13, from 6 to 
9 PM in the Joyhouse. Enjoy food, fellowship, and trivia, provided by a 
professional trivia company. Catered dinner and prizes awarded. Don’t be 
late! Trivia begins promptly at 7.  Cost is $10 per family. Visit the Events page 
on our website to sign up. 

Church Dialogue on Denominational Relationships: The Denominational 
Emphasis Committee invites you to the Chapel on April 14, from 4 to 5:30 PM 
for a special time of dialogue.  Hear about current events in Baptist life, how 
our church relates to the various Baptist organizations we partner with, and 
how you can be more involved.  For more information, please contact Logan 
Carpenter at logan@fbroswell.org. 
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